
RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>
911 Emergency 

Telecommunications
Accounting

Advanced Animal 

Science

Advanced 

Animation

Advanced Plant 

& Soil Science

Vendors

Aerowave Technologies

All American Balloons Wholesale

Alternator Service, Inc.

American Agro Products

American Auto Salvage

Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, 

LLC.

Andrea Communications, LLC.

Apogee Components



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>
911 Emergency 

Telecommunications
Accounting

Advanced Animal 

Science

Advanced 

Animation

Advanced Plant 

& Soil Science

Vendors

Armstrong McCall

Atech Training, Inc.

Aves Audio Visual Systems, Inc.

B&H Photo

Burmax

BWI Companies, Inc. X

Carolina Biological Supply, Co. X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>
911 Emergency 

Telecommunications
Accounting

Advanced Animal 

Science

Advanced 

Animation

Advanced Plant 

& Soil Science

Vendors

CDW Government, LLC.

Cengage Learning Group X X X X

CEV Multimedia X X X

Chef Works, Inc.

Commercial Van Interiors

Continental Wireless, Inc. X

Educational Innovations



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>
911 Emergency 

Telecommunications
Accounting

Advanced Animal 

Science

Advanced 

Animation

Advanced Plant 

& Soil Science

Vendors

EmbroidMe

Fredericksburg Education Initiative, Inc.

DBA: SystemsGo

Gavson, Inc.

GTM Sportswear

Hertz Furniture X X X X X

Impact Promotional Services, LLC.

DBA  GYC Uniforms

Industrial Controls

Ipevo

Jolly Farmer Products US, Inc.



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>
911 Emergency 

Telecommunications
Accounting

Advanced Animal 

Science

Advanced 

Animation

Advanced Plant 

& Soil Science

Vendors

KAMICO Industrial Medial, Inc.

Kari Langford X X X X X

Lab Resources, Inc.

Lakeshore Learning

Marianna Beauty

Mometrix Test Preparation

Morgan Electric

Morton Publishing, Co.

Nasco X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>
911 Emergency 

Telecommunications
Accounting

Advanced Animal 

Science

Advanced 

Animation

Advanced Plant 

& Soil Science

Vendors

Norton Metals

Nylynn Beauty Products

Ozark Delight Candy Co.

Paxton/Patterson

Penn State Industries

Pivot Point International, Inc.



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>
911 Emergency 

Telecommunications
Accounting

Advanced Animal 

Science

Advanced 

Animation

Advanced Plant 

& Soil Science

Vendors

Pocket Nurse

Project Lead the Way

Public Missiles Ltd.

Quality Audio Visual Service, Inc.

RealityWorks, Inc.

Sargent Welch

School Speciality X X

Sempco Inc

StuKent, Inc.



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>
911 Emergency 

Telecommunications
Accounting

Advanced Animal 

Science

Advanced 

Animation

Advanced Plant 

& Soil Science

Vendors

Teacher Direct

Texas Pride Marketing

Troxell Communications X

U, Inc. DBA S/P2

Vex Robotics

Ward's Science

WB Hunt Co, Inc.

Blank Cell = No Bid

Present at Opening:

Tiffany Mullins, BISD Purchasing

Erika Ayala, BISD Purchasing

Shelley Freeman, BISD Purchasing

GTM Sportswear disqualified due to lack of clarification response

CDW Government, LLC. disqualified due to additonal terms & conditions 



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Aerowave Technologies

All American Balloons Wholesale

Alternator Service, Inc.

American Agro Products

American Auto Salvage

Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, 

LLC.

Andrea Communications, LLC.

Apogee Components

Aerospace 

Engineering
Architectural Design

Audio Video 

Production

Automotive 

Technology
CISCO Systems Clinical Rotation

X

X

X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Armstrong McCall

Atech Training, Inc.

Aves Audio Visual Systems, Inc.

B&H Photo

Burmax

BWI Companies, Inc.

Carolina Biological Supply, Co.

Aerospace 

Engineering
Architectural Design

Audio Video 

Production

Automotive 

Technology
CISCO Systems Clinical Rotation

X

X

X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

CDW Government, LLC.

Cengage Learning Group

CEV Multimedia

Chef Works, Inc.

Commercial Van Interiors

Continental Wireless, Inc.

Educational Innovations

Aerospace 

Engineering
Architectural Design

Audio Video 

Production

Automotive 

Technology
CISCO Systems Clinical Rotation

X

X X X X

X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

EmbroidMe

Fredericksburg Education Initiative, Inc.

DBA: SystemsGo

Gavson, Inc.

GTM Sportswear

Hertz Furniture

Impact Promotional Services, LLC.

DBA  GYC Uniforms

Industrial Controls

Ipevo

Jolly Farmer Products US, Inc.

Aerospace 

Engineering
Architectural Design

Audio Video 

Production

Automotive 

Technology
CISCO Systems Clinical Rotation

X

X X X X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

KAMICO Industrial Medial, Inc.

Kari Langford

Lab Resources, Inc.

Lakeshore Learning

Marianna Beauty

Mometrix Test Preparation

Morgan Electric

Morton Publishing, Co.

Nasco

Aerospace 

Engineering
Architectural Design

Audio Video 

Production

Automotive 

Technology
CISCO Systems Clinical Rotation

X X X X X X

X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Norton Metals

Nylynn Beauty Products

Ozark Delight Candy Co.

Paxton/Patterson

Penn State Industries

Pivot Point International, Inc.

Aerospace 

Engineering
Architectural Design

Audio Video 

Production

Automotive 

Technology
CISCO Systems Clinical Rotation



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Pocket Nurse

Project Lead the Way

Public Missiles Ltd.

Quality Audio Visual Service, Inc.

RealityWorks, Inc.

Sargent Welch

School Speciality

Sempco Inc

StuKent, Inc.

Aerospace 

Engineering
Architectural Design

Audio Video 

Production

Automotive 

Technology
CISCO Systems Clinical Rotation

X

X X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Teacher Direct

Texas Pride Marketing

Troxell Communications

U, Inc. DBA S/P2

Vex Robotics

Ward's Science

WB Hunt Co, Inc.

Blank Cell = No Bid

Present at Opening:

Tiffany Mullins, BISD Purchasing

Erika Ayala, BISD Purchasing

Shelley Freeman, BISD Purchasing

GTM Sportswear disqualified due to lack of clarification response

CDW Government, LLC. disqualified due to additonal terms & conditions 

Aerospace 

Engineering
Architectural Design

Audio Video 

Production

Automotive 

Technology
CISCO Systems Clinical Rotation

X

X

X

X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Aerowave Technologies

All American Balloons Wholesale

Alternator Service, Inc.

American Agro Products

American Auto Salvage

Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, 

LLC.

Andrea Communications, LLC.

Apogee Components

Computer Integr. 

Mfg./Maker Class

Computer 

Maintenance

Computer 

Technology

Construction 

Technology
Cosmetology

Court Systems & 

Practices

X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Armstrong McCall

Atech Training, Inc.

Aves Audio Visual Systems, Inc.

B&H Photo

Burmax

BWI Companies, Inc.

Carolina Biological Supply, Co.

Computer Integr. 

Mfg./Maker Class

Computer 

Maintenance

Computer 

Technology

Construction 

Technology
Cosmetology

Court Systems & 

Practices

X

X

X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

CDW Government, LLC.

Cengage Learning Group

CEV Multimedia

Chef Works, Inc.

Commercial Van Interiors

Continental Wireless, Inc.

Educational Innovations

Computer Integr. 

Mfg./Maker Class

Computer 

Maintenance

Computer 

Technology

Construction 

Technology
Cosmetology

Court Systems & 

Practices

X X

X X X X

X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

EmbroidMe

Fredericksburg Education Initiative, Inc.

DBA: SystemsGo

Gavson, Inc.

GTM Sportswear

Hertz Furniture

Impact Promotional Services, LLC.

DBA  GYC Uniforms

Industrial Controls

Ipevo

Jolly Farmer Products US, Inc.

Computer Integr. 

Mfg./Maker Class

Computer 

Maintenance

Computer 

Technology

Construction 

Technology
Cosmetology

Court Systems & 

Practices

X

X X X X X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

KAMICO Industrial Medial, Inc.

Kari Langford

Lab Resources, Inc.

Lakeshore Learning

Marianna Beauty

Mometrix Test Preparation

Morgan Electric

Morton Publishing, Co.

Nasco

Computer Integr. 

Mfg./Maker Class

Computer 

Maintenance

Computer 

Technology

Construction 

Technology
Cosmetology

Court Systems & 

Practices

X X X X X X

X

X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Norton Metals

Nylynn Beauty Products

Ozark Delight Candy Co.

Paxton/Patterson

Penn State Industries

Pivot Point International, Inc.

Computer Integr. 

Mfg./Maker Class

Computer 

Maintenance

Computer 

Technology

Construction 

Technology
Cosmetology

Court Systems & 

Practices

X

X

X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Pocket Nurse

Project Lead the Way

Public Missiles Ltd.

Quality Audio Visual Service, Inc.

RealityWorks, Inc.

Sargent Welch

School Speciality

Sempco Inc

StuKent, Inc.

Computer Integr. 

Mfg./Maker Class

Computer 

Maintenance

Computer 

Technology

Construction 

Technology
Cosmetology

Court Systems & 

Practices

X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Teacher Direct

Texas Pride Marketing

Troxell Communications

U, Inc. DBA S/P2

Vex Robotics

Ward's Science

WB Hunt Co, Inc.

Blank Cell = No Bid

Present at Opening:

Tiffany Mullins, BISD Purchasing

Erika Ayala, BISD Purchasing

Shelley Freeman, BISD Purchasing

GTM Sportswear disqualified due to lack of clarification response

CDW Government, LLC. disqualified due to additonal terms & conditions 

Computer Integr. 

Mfg./Maker Class

Computer 

Maintenance

Computer 

Technology

Construction 

Technology
Cosmetology

Court Systems & 

Practices

X X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Aerowave Technologies

All American Balloons Wholesale

Alternator Service, Inc.

American Agro Products

American Auto Salvage

Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, 

LLC.

Andrea Communications, LLC.

Apogee Components

Criminal Investigations Culinary Arts Digital Electronics

Digital & 

Interactive 

Media

EKG/Phlebotomy 

Technician

Education & 

Training

X

X X

X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Armstrong McCall

Atech Training, Inc.

Aves Audio Visual Systems, Inc.

B&H Photo

Burmax

BWI Companies, Inc.

Carolina Biological Supply, Co.

Criminal Investigations Culinary Arts Digital Electronics

Digital & 

Interactive 

Media

EKG/Phlebotomy 

Technician

Education & 

Training

X X

X X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

CDW Government, LLC.

Cengage Learning Group

CEV Multimedia

Chef Works, Inc.

Commercial Van Interiors

Continental Wireless, Inc.

Educational Innovations

Criminal Investigations Culinary Arts Digital Electronics

Digital & 

Interactive 

Media

EKG/Phlebotomy 

Technician

Education & 

Training

X X X

X X X X X

X X X

X

X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

EmbroidMe

Fredericksburg Education Initiative, Inc.

DBA: SystemsGo

Gavson, Inc.

GTM Sportswear

Hertz Furniture

Impact Promotional Services, LLC.

DBA  GYC Uniforms

Industrial Controls

Ipevo

Jolly Farmer Products US, Inc.

Criminal Investigations Culinary Arts Digital Electronics

Digital & 

Interactive 

Media

EKG/Phlebotomy 

Technician

Education & 

Training

X X X X X X

X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

KAMICO Industrial Medial, Inc.

Kari Langford

Lab Resources, Inc.

Lakeshore Learning

Marianna Beauty

Mometrix Test Preparation

Morgan Electric

Morton Publishing, Co.

Nasco

Criminal Investigations Culinary Arts Digital Electronics

Digital & 

Interactive 

Media

EKG/Phlebotomy 

Technician

Education & 

Training

X

X X X X X X

X

X

X

X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Norton Metals

Nylynn Beauty Products

Ozark Delight Candy Co.

Paxton/Patterson

Penn State Industries

Pivot Point International, Inc.

Criminal Investigations Culinary Arts Digital Electronics

Digital & 

Interactive 

Media

EKG/Phlebotomy 

Technician

Education & 

Training



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Pocket Nurse

Project Lead the Way

Public Missiles Ltd.

Quality Audio Visual Service, Inc.

RealityWorks, Inc.

Sargent Welch

School Speciality

Sempco Inc

StuKent, Inc.

Criminal Investigations Culinary Arts Digital Electronics

Digital & 

Interactive 

Media

EKG/Phlebotomy 

Technician

Education & 

Training

X

X

X

X X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Teacher Direct

Texas Pride Marketing

Troxell Communications

U, Inc. DBA S/P2

Vex Robotics

Ward's Science

WB Hunt Co, Inc.

Blank Cell = No Bid

Present at Opening:

Tiffany Mullins, BISD Purchasing

Erika Ayala, BISD Purchasing

Shelley Freeman, BISD Purchasing

GTM Sportswear disqualified due to lack of clarification response

CDW Government, LLC. disqualified due to additonal terms & conditions 

Criminal Investigations Culinary Arts Digital Electronics

Digital & 

Interactive 

Media

EKG/Phlebotomy 

Technician

Education & 

Training

X X X

X

X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Aerowave Technologies

All American Balloons Wholesale

Alternator Service, Inc.

American Agro Products

American Auto Salvage

Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, 

LLC.

Andrea Communications, LLC.

Apogee Components

Emergency 

Medical  

Technician

Equine Science Firefighter Forensic Science
Global/Virtual 

Business
Health Science

X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Armstrong McCall

Atech Training, Inc.

Aves Audio Visual Systems, Inc.

B&H Photo

Burmax

BWI Companies, Inc.

Carolina Biological Supply, Co.

Emergency 

Medical  

Technician

Equine Science Firefighter Forensic Science
Global/Virtual 

Business
Health Science

X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

CDW Government, LLC.

Cengage Learning Group

CEV Multimedia

Chef Works, Inc.

Commercial Van Interiors

Continental Wireless, Inc.

Educational Innovations

Emergency 

Medical  

Technician

Equine Science Firefighter Forensic Science
Global/Virtual 

Business
Health Science

X X X X X

X X X X

X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

EmbroidMe

Fredericksburg Education Initiative, Inc.

DBA: SystemsGo

Gavson, Inc.

GTM Sportswear

Hertz Furniture

Impact Promotional Services, LLC.

DBA  GYC Uniforms

Industrial Controls

Ipevo

Jolly Farmer Products US, Inc.

Emergency 

Medical  

Technician

Equine Science Firefighter Forensic Science
Global/Virtual 

Business
Health Science

X X X X X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

KAMICO Industrial Medial, Inc.

Kari Langford

Lab Resources, Inc.

Lakeshore Learning

Marianna Beauty

Mometrix Test Preparation

Morgan Electric

Morton Publishing, Co.

Nasco

Emergency 

Medical  

Technician

Equine Science Firefighter Forensic Science
Global/Virtual 

Business
Health Science

X X X X X X

X

X X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Norton Metals

Nylynn Beauty Products

Ozark Delight Candy Co.

Paxton/Patterson

Penn State Industries

Pivot Point International, Inc.

Emergency 

Medical  

Technician

Equine Science Firefighter Forensic Science
Global/Virtual 

Business
Health Science



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Pocket Nurse

Project Lead the Way

Public Missiles Ltd.

Quality Audio Visual Service, Inc.

RealityWorks, Inc.

Sargent Welch

School Speciality

Sempco Inc

StuKent, Inc.

Emergency 

Medical  

Technician

Equine Science Firefighter Forensic Science
Global/Virtual 

Business
Health Science

X

X X

X X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Teacher Direct

Texas Pride Marketing

Troxell Communications

U, Inc. DBA S/P2

Vex Robotics

Ward's Science

WB Hunt Co, Inc.

Blank Cell = No Bid

Present at Opening:

Tiffany Mullins, BISD Purchasing

Erika Ayala, BISD Purchasing

Shelley Freeman, BISD Purchasing

GTM Sportswear disqualified due to lack of clarification response

CDW Government, LLC. disqualified due to additonal terms & conditions 

Emergency 

Medical  

Technician

Equine Science Firefighter Forensic Science
Global/Virtual 

Business
Health Science

X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Aerowave Technologies

All American Balloons Wholesale

Alternator Service, Inc.

American Agro Products

American Auto Salvage

Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, 

LLC.

Andrea Communications, LLC.

Apogee Components

Honors Anatomy 

& Physiology

Horticulture 

Science
Hotel Management Law Enforcement

Livestock 

Production

Medical 

Microbiology

X

X

X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Armstrong McCall

Atech Training, Inc.

Aves Audio Visual Systems, Inc.

B&H Photo

Burmax

BWI Companies, Inc.

Carolina Biological Supply, Co.

Honors Anatomy 

& Physiology

Horticulture 

Science
Hotel Management Law Enforcement

Livestock 

Production

Medical 

Microbiology

X X

X X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

CDW Government, LLC.

Cengage Learning Group

CEV Multimedia

Chef Works, Inc.

Commercial Van Interiors

Continental Wireless, Inc.

Educational Innovations

Honors Anatomy 

& Physiology

Horticulture 

Science
Hotel Management Law Enforcement

Livestock 

Production

Medical 

Microbiology

X X X X X X

X X X X

X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

EmbroidMe

Fredericksburg Education Initiative, Inc.

DBA: SystemsGo

Gavson, Inc.

GTM Sportswear

Hertz Furniture

Impact Promotional Services, LLC.

DBA  GYC Uniforms

Industrial Controls

Ipevo

Jolly Farmer Products US, Inc.

Honors Anatomy 

& Physiology

Horticulture 

Science
Hotel Management Law Enforcement

Livestock 

Production

Medical 

Microbiology

X X X X X X

X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

KAMICO Industrial Medial, Inc.

Kari Langford

Lab Resources, Inc.

Lakeshore Learning

Marianna Beauty

Mometrix Test Preparation

Morgan Electric

Morton Publishing, Co.

Nasco

Honors Anatomy 

& Physiology

Horticulture 

Science
Hotel Management Law Enforcement

Livestock 

Production

Medical 

Microbiology

X X X X X X

X X

X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Norton Metals

Nylynn Beauty Products

Ozark Delight Candy Co.

Paxton/Patterson

Penn State Industries

Pivot Point International, Inc.

Honors Anatomy 

& Physiology

Horticulture 

Science
Hotel Management Law Enforcement

Livestock 

Production

Medical 

Microbiology



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Pocket Nurse

Project Lead the Way

Public Missiles Ltd.

Quality Audio Visual Service, Inc.

RealityWorks, Inc.

Sargent Welch

School Speciality

Sempco Inc

StuKent, Inc.

Honors Anatomy 

& Physiology

Horticulture 

Science
Hotel Management Law Enforcement

Livestock 

Production

Medical 

Microbiology

X

X X

X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Teacher Direct

Texas Pride Marketing

Troxell Communications

U, Inc. DBA S/P2

Vex Robotics

Ward's Science

WB Hunt Co, Inc.

Blank Cell = No Bid

Present at Opening:

Tiffany Mullins, BISD Purchasing

Erika Ayala, BISD Purchasing

Shelley Freeman, BISD Purchasing

GTM Sportswear disqualified due to lack of clarification response

CDW Government, LLC. disqualified due to additonal terms & conditions 

Honors Anatomy 

& Physiology

Horticulture 

Science
Hotel Management Law Enforcement

Livestock 

Production

Medical 

Microbiology

X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Aerowave Technologies

All American Balloons Wholesale

Alternator Service, Inc.

American Agro Products

American Auto Salvage

Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, 

LLC.

Andrea Communications, LLC.

Apogee Components

Pathophysiology Pharmacology
Practicum In Business 

Management

Principles & 

Elements of 

Floral Design

Prin. Agriculture, 

Food and Natural 

Res.

X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Armstrong McCall

Atech Training, Inc.

Aves Audio Visual Systems, Inc.

B&H Photo

Burmax

BWI Companies, Inc.

Carolina Biological Supply, Co.

Pathophysiology Pharmacology
Practicum In Business 

Management

Principles & 

Elements of 

Floral Design

Prin. Agriculture, 

Food and Natural 

Res.



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

CDW Government, LLC.

Cengage Learning Group

CEV Multimedia

Chef Works, Inc.

Commercial Van Interiors

Continental Wireless, Inc.

Educational Innovations

Pathophysiology Pharmacology
Practicum In Business 

Management

Principles & 

Elements of 

Floral Design

Prin. Agriculture, 

Food and Natural 

Res.

X X X X X

X X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

EmbroidMe

Fredericksburg Education Initiative, Inc.

DBA: SystemsGo

Gavson, Inc.

GTM Sportswear

Hertz Furniture

Impact Promotional Services, LLC.

DBA  GYC Uniforms

Industrial Controls

Ipevo

Jolly Farmer Products US, Inc.

Pathophysiology Pharmacology
Practicum In Business 

Management

Principles & 

Elements of 

Floral Design

Prin. Agriculture, 

Food and Natural 

Res.

X X X X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

KAMICO Industrial Medial, Inc.

Kari Langford

Lab Resources, Inc.

Lakeshore Learning

Marianna Beauty

Mometrix Test Preparation

Morgan Electric

Morton Publishing, Co.

Nasco

Pathophysiology Pharmacology
Practicum In Business 

Management

Principles & 

Elements of 

Floral Design

Prin. Agriculture, 

Food and Natural 

Res.

X X X X X

X

X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Norton Metals

Nylynn Beauty Products

Ozark Delight Candy Co.

Paxton/Patterson

Penn State Industries

Pivot Point International, Inc.

Pathophysiology Pharmacology
Practicum In Business 

Management

Principles & 

Elements of 

Floral Design

Prin. Agriculture, 

Food and Natural 

Res.



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Pocket Nurse

Project Lead the Way

Public Missiles Ltd.

Quality Audio Visual Service, Inc.

RealityWorks, Inc.

Sargent Welch

School Speciality

Sempco Inc

StuKent, Inc.

Pathophysiology Pharmacology
Practicum In Business 

Management

Principles & 

Elements of 

Floral Design

Prin. Agriculture, 

Food and Natural 

Res.



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Teacher Direct

Texas Pride Marketing

Troxell Communications

U, Inc. DBA S/P2

Vex Robotics

Ward's Science

WB Hunt Co, Inc.

Blank Cell = No Bid

Present at Opening:

Tiffany Mullins, BISD Purchasing

Erika Ayala, BISD Purchasing

Shelley Freeman, BISD Purchasing

GTM Sportswear disqualified due to lack of clarification response

CDW Government, LLC. disqualified due to additonal terms & conditions 

Pathophysiology Pharmacology
Practicum In Business 

Management

Principles & 

Elements of 

Floral Design

Prin. Agriculture, 

Food and Natural 

Res.



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Aerowave Technologies

All American Balloons Wholesale

Alternator Service, Inc.

American Agro Products

American Auto Salvage

Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, 

LLC.

Andrea Communications, LLC.

Apogee Components

Principles of 

Engineering

Principles of Law 

& Public Safety
Rocket Engineering Travel & Tourism Other

Two Way Radios

Bus Part

Floral Supplies

Automotive Parts

Medical Equipment & 

supplies.  Athletic trainer 

supplies.

Headphones & Headsets

X X



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Armstrong McCall

Atech Training, Inc.

Aves Audio Visual Systems, Inc.

B&H Photo

Burmax

BWI Companies, Inc.

Carolina Biological Supply, Co.

Principles of 

Engineering

Principles of Law 

& Public Safety
Rocket Engineering Travel & Tourism Other

Landscape material, 

fertilizers & chemicals



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

CDW Government, LLC.

Cengage Learning Group

CEV Multimedia

Chef Works, Inc.

Commercial Van Interiors

Continental Wireless, Inc.

Educational Innovations

Principles of 

Engineering

Principles of Law 

& Public Safety
Rocket Engineering Travel & Tourism Other

X X X X

X

Two-way Radios & 

Accessories

X Science Supplies



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

EmbroidMe

Fredericksburg Education Initiative, Inc.

DBA: SystemsGo

Gavson, Inc.

GTM Sportswear

Hertz Furniture

Impact Promotional Services, LLC.

DBA  GYC Uniforms

Industrial Controls

Ipevo

Jolly Farmer Products US, Inc.

Principles of 

Engineering

Principles of Law 

& Public Safety
Rocket Engineering Travel & Tourism Other

X X

Athletic Apparel

X X X X

Uniforms/Equipment

HVAC Maintenance Parts

Greenhouse Plants



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

KAMICO Industrial Medial, Inc.

Kari Langford

Lab Resources, Inc.

Lakeshore Learning

Marianna Beauty

Mometrix Test Preparation

Morgan Electric

Morton Publishing, Co.

Nasco

Principles of 

Engineering

Principles of Law 

& Public Safety
Rocket Engineering Travel & Tourism Other

Professional 

Development

X X X X

Educational Materials

Elecrical Service

See Attached

https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_08_30_12_39_26.pdf


RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Norton Metals

Nylynn Beauty Products

Ozark Delight Candy Co.

Paxton/Patterson

Penn State Industries

Pivot Point International, Inc.

Principles of 

Engineering

Principles of Law 

& Public Safety
Rocket Engineering Travel & Tourism Other

Steel, metal building 

compnents

Fundraising

Vocational Supplies

Woodworking Equipment 

& Supplies



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Pocket Nurse

Project Lead the Way

Public Missiles Ltd.

Quality Audio Visual Service, Inc.

RealityWorks, Inc.

Sargent Welch

School Speciality

Sempco Inc

StuKent, Inc.

Principles of 

Engineering

Principles of Law 

& Public Safety
Rocket Engineering Travel & Tourism Other

X

X

Audio Visual Equipment

Science Teaching Supplies 

& Equipment

Instructional Materials

Marketing



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Teacher Direct

Texas Pride Marketing

Troxell Communications

U, Inc. DBA S/P2

Vex Robotics

Ward's Science

WB Hunt Co, Inc.

Blank Cell = No Bid

Present at Opening:

Tiffany Mullins, BISD Purchasing

Erika Ayala, BISD Purchasing

Shelley Freeman, BISD Purchasing

GTM Sportswear disqualified due to lack of clarification response

CDW Government, LLC. disqualified due to additonal terms & conditions 

Principles of 

Engineering

Principles of Law 

& Public Safety
Rocket Engineering Travel & Tourism Other

School Office Supplies

See attached

Educational Robotics

Science Teaching Supplies 

& Equipment

https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_18_14_11_04.pdf


RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Aerowave Technologies

All American Balloons Wholesale

Alternator Service, Inc.

American Agro Products

American Auto Salvage

Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, 

LLC.

Andrea Communications, LLC.

Apogee Components

Catalog Discount 

off Supplies & 

Equipment

Service - 

Discount off 

Parts

Service - Hourly Rate for 

Onsite Repairs/Services

Service - Trip Charge for 

Onsite Repairs/Services

12% 12% $95.00 $30.00

25-60% off MSRP
25-60% off 

MSRP
by phone by mail

10% 10% $85.00 $0.00

0%

0% 0%

5%

20%
No charge for technical 

support

0% 0%



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Armstrong McCall

Atech Training, Inc.

Aves Audio Visual Systems, Inc.

B&H Photo

Burmax

BWI Companies, Inc.

Carolina Biological Supply, Co.

Catalog Discount 

off Supplies & 

Equipment

Service - 

Discount off 

Parts

Service - Hourly Rate for 

Onsite Repairs/Services

Service - Trip Charge for 

Onsite Repairs/Services

0% 0%

0% 0%

7-30%

2-25% as per 

National IPA 

Contract R160901

2-25%

5% Burmax items 

only. See 

attachment

0% 0%

5% See attachment 

for discount 

exclusions and 

freight terms

https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_08_30_12_04_55.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_08_30_12_04_55.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_08_30_12_04_55.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_11_10_26_03.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_11_10_26_03.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_11_10_26_03.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_11_10_26_03.pdf


RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

CDW Government, LLC.

Cengage Learning Group

CEV Multimedia

Chef Works, Inc.

Commercial Van Interiors

Continental Wireless, Inc.

Educational Innovations

Catalog Discount 

off Supplies & 

Equipment

Service - 

Discount off 

Parts

Service - Hourly Rate for 

Onsite Repairs/Services

Service - Trip Charge for 

Onsite Repairs/Services

Varies

See attached TCPN 

discount list

0% depending 

on build

0%

0%

35%

10% 10% $75.00 / hr. $0.00

20% off MSRP 20% off MSRP $85.00 / hr. $50.00

7%

https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_18_11_20_23.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_18_11_20_23.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_18_11_20_23.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_18_11_20_23.pdf


RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

EmbroidMe

Fredericksburg Education Initiative, Inc.

DBA: SystemsGo

Gavson, Inc.

GTM Sportswear

Hertz Furniture

Impact Promotional Services, LLC.

DBA  GYC Uniforms

Industrial Controls

Ipevo

Jolly Farmer Products US, Inc.

Catalog Discount 

off Supplies & 

Equipment

Service - 

Discount off 

Parts

Service - Hourly Rate for 

Onsite Repairs/Services

Service - Trip Charge for 

Onsite Repairs/Services

10%

0% 0%

0%

We have a school 

catalog with special 

school pricing

10% Apparel

20% Uniforms & 

Warmups

2-62% depending 

on products/vendor

20% MSRP 

All in store and 

online brands.

Exclusions - gift 

cards, nebo, 

earphone connect

10% Alterations 

& Embroidery 

Price List

50% 50%

5%

0% Level 1 of price 

list attached

https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_11_10_42_45.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_11_10_42_45.pdf


RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

KAMICO Industrial Medial, Inc.

Kari Langford

Lab Resources, Inc.

Lakeshore Learning

Marianna Beauty

Mometrix Test Preparation

Morgan Electric

Morton Publishing, Co.

Nasco

Catalog Discount 

off Supplies & 

Equipment

Service - 

Discount off 

Parts

Service - Hourly Rate for 

Onsite Repairs/Services

Service - Trip Charge for 

Onsite Repairs/Services

0-15% depending 

on item & quantity.

Flat fee of $1500 for 

6 hours of TEA-

approved 

Professional 

Development.

10%

0%

5% Lakeshore Early 

Childhood Catalog 

& Lakeshore 

Elementary Catalog

0% Pricing listed in 

School Buying 

Guide is exclusive 

to schools

0-40% See attached 

charge for 

explination

10% $125.00

20%

10-20%

https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_03_09_22_00.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_03_09_22_00.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_03_09_22_00.pdf


RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Norton Metals

Nylynn Beauty Products

Ozark Delight Candy Co.

Paxton/Patterson

Penn State Industries

Pivot Point International, Inc.

Catalog Discount 

off Supplies & 

Equipment

Service - 

Discount off 

Parts

Service - Hourly Rate for 

Onsite Repairs/Services

Service - Trip Charge for 

Onsite Repairs/Services

10%

20% of Salon

0%

10%

0% 0%

0% 0%



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Pocket Nurse

Project Lead the Way

Public Missiles Ltd.

Quality Audio Visual Service, Inc.

RealityWorks, Inc.

Sargent Welch

School Speciality

Sempco Inc

StuKent, Inc.

Catalog Discount 

off Supplies & 

Equipment

Service - 

Discount off 

Parts

Service - Hourly Rate for 

Onsite Repairs/Services

Service - Trip Charge for 

Onsite Repairs/Services

Avg. 10%

Click attachment for 

explination & 

exceptions

0%

10%

0% 0% $65.00 $35.00

0% 0%

33% 

See attachment for 

exceptions

31% off current list 

price on supplies.

14% off current list 

price on furniture.

15%

Varies 0%

https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_08_30_13_33_21.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_08_30_13_33_21.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_08_30_13_33_21.pdf


RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Teacher Direct

Texas Pride Marketing

Troxell Communications

U, Inc. DBA S/P2

Vex Robotics

Ward's Science

WB Hunt Co, Inc.

Blank Cell = No Bid

Present at Opening:

Tiffany Mullins, BISD Purchasing

Erika Ayala, BISD Purchasing

Shelley Freeman, BISD Purchasing

GTM Sportswear disqualified due to lack of clarification response

CDW Government, LLC. disqualified due to additonal terms & conditions 

Catalog Discount 

off Supplies & 

Equipment

Service - 

Discount off 

Parts

Service - Hourly Rate for 

Onsite Repairs/Services

Service - Trip Charge for 

Onsite Repairs/Services

5%

5%

1-70% 1-70% $100 per man hour
Contact Loretta Padilla 

for quote

0% 0%

0%

18% 

See attchment for 

exceptions to the 

discount & freight

4-30%

No discount given 

on Nikon MVP, 

Sony Sure, Canon 

Cinema or 

manufacturer 

locked pricing.

10%

https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_17_10_21_14.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_17_10_21_14.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_17_10_21_14.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_17_10_21_14.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_17_10_21_14.pdf


RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Aerowave Technologies

All American Balloons Wholesale

Alternator Service, Inc.

American Agro Products

American Auto Salvage

Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, 

LLC.

Andrea Communications, LLC.

Apogee Components

Shipping/Delivery Additional Notes EPCNT

Shipping Cost - $15.00

Average Delivery - 5-7 business days

Max Delivery - 15 business days

Yes

Shipping Cost - Ground UPS

Average Delivery - 14-21 days

Max Delivery - 45 days due to 

backorders w/ no substitutions

Yes

Shipping Cost - $0

Average Delivery - same day 

Max Delivery - 24 hours

Yes

Shipping Cost - $15.00

Average Delivery - 24 hours

Max Delivery - 48 hours

Yes

Shipping Cost - $0

Average Delivery - 1-3 days

Max Delivery - 5 days

Yes

Shipping Cost - varies by weight & 

location

Average Delivery - 2 weeks; 

excluding custom orders and special 

items

Max Delivery - 2-4 weeks depending 

on volume

Yes

Shipping Cost - TBD based on 

quantity and location.  Free shipping 

on all orders over quantities of 100 

units.

Average Delivery - 4-5 days

Max Delivery - 2 weeks

Yes

Shipping Cost - dependant on items.  

Please calculate your shipping at 

www.apogeerockets.com/quick_ord

er

Average Delivery - You choose your 

method.  Orders ship same day if 

recevied by 2 PM MST

Max Delivery - See Average Delivery.  

Motors have eto go ground shipping 

which can take 1-2 weeks

Yes



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Armstrong McCall

Atech Training, Inc.

Aves Audio Visual Systems, Inc.

B&H Photo

Burmax

BWI Companies, Inc.

Carolina Biological Supply, Co.

Shipping/Delivery Additional Notes EPCNT

Shipping Cost - Free

Average Delivery - week

Max Delivery - week

Yes

Shippng Cost - Free Delivery 

Average Delivery - 60-90 days ARO

Max Delivery - 120 days ARO

Yes

Shipping Cost - Free Freight

Average Delivery - 5/10 days ARO

Max Delivery - 10-14 days

Yes

Shipping Cost - Free.  Products 

weighing more than 70 lbs. or 

requiring truck delivery will be 

charged reasonable shipping.

Average Delivery - 7-14 days

Max Delivery - 14 days

Must Reference 

#744972420 on all quote & 

PO request

Yes

Shipping Cost - Free Freight except 

on direct ship items & 

manufacturers.  See attachment

Yes

Shipping Cost - No charge with $400 

minimum order

Average Delivery - 2-3 days

Yes

Shipping Cost - See attachment

Average Delivery - 3-5 days

Max Delivery - 45 days

Reference P105643 on all 

PO's and correspondance
No

https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_08_30_12_05_16.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_08_30_12_05_16.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_08_30_12_05_16.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_08_30_12_05_16.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_11_10_26_03.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_11_10_26_03.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_11_10_26_03.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_11_10_26_03.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_11_10_26_03.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_11_10_26_03.pdf


RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

CDW Government, LLC.

Cengage Learning Group

CEV Multimedia

Chef Works, Inc.

Commercial Van Interiors

Continental Wireless, Inc.

Educational Innovations

Shipping/Delivery Additional Notes EPCNT

Shipping Cost - $0

Average Delivery - 2-10 business 

days

Max Delivery - 10 business days

CDW-G submits this bid 

response subject only to the 

terms and conditoins 

contained in the current 

TCPN contract agreement.  

Any terms and conditions in 

the bid or elseware that are 

additional to or different 

from the terms and 

conditions of that 

agreement shall not apply 

to any transaction that 

results from CDW-G 

submission of its bid 

response.

No

Shipping Cost - Estimated delivery is 

10% of the total order.  Actual 

shipping/handling charges will be 

invluded in the invoice total

Yes

Shipping Cost - N/A Online 

Subscriptions

Maximum Delivery - 10 days after 

receipt of signed PO and all required 

information

Yes

Shipping Cost - $9.95 and up

Average Delivery - 5 business days

Max Delivery - 12 business days

Yes

Shipping Cost - $0 No

Shipping Cost - Free on orders over 

$50.00

Average Delivery - 10-30 days

Max Delivery - 35 days

Yes

Shipping Cost - $0

Average Delivery - 3-5 business days

Free shipping does not 

apply to bulky items below:

AIR-200, BOT-600, BOT-672, 

SUN-100.  These items will 

incur shipping charges

Yes



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

EmbroidMe

Fredericksburg Education Initiative, Inc.

DBA: SystemsGo

Gavson, Inc.

GTM Sportswear

Hertz Furniture

Impact Promotional Services, LLC.

DBA  GYC Uniforms

Industrial Controls

Ipevo

Jolly Farmer Products US, Inc.

Shipping/Delivery Additional Notes EPCNT

Shipping Cost - included in pricing

Average Delivery - 7 days

Max Delivery - 7 days

Yes

Shipping Cost - $12 for orders up to 

$120/10% of order total for orders 

over $120

Average Delivery - 1 week

Max Delivery - 2 weeks

Yes

Shipping Cost - This is billed 

spereately and will be according to 

the valuse of order.

Average Delivery - 15 working days

Max Delivery - 30 days

Yes

Shipping Cost - <$100 = $5.95

Average Delivery - 2-3 weeks stock 

items; 5-7 weeks custom

Shipping Cost - $0

Average Delivery - 7-21 days

Max Delivery - 45 days

Click for list of 

manufacturers, their 

dicounts, delivery & 

warranty info

Yes

Shipping Cost - $0

Average Delivery - 21 days

Max Delivery - 45 days

Yes

Shipping Cost - $0

Average Delivery - 2-3 days

Max Delivery - 7 days

Yes

Shipping Cost - $0

Average Delivery - 3 working days

Max Delivery - 6 working days

Yes

Shipping Cost - included in price for 

4 boses (full) or more

Average Delivery - 2 days

Max Delivery - 2 days

Yes

https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_04_16_03_07.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_04_16_03_07.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_04_16_03_07.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_04_16_03_07.pdf


RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

KAMICO Industrial Medial, Inc.

Kari Langford

Lab Resources, Inc.

Lakeshore Learning

Marianna Beauty

Mometrix Test Preparation

Morgan Electric

Morton Publishing, Co.

Nasco

Shipping/Delivery Additional Notes EPCNT

Shipping Cost - Free shipping on all 

orders. No minimum requirement

Average Delivery - 2 days ARO

Max Delivery - 3 days ARO

Yes

Shipping Cost - $7 flat fee

Average Delivery - 7 days

Max Delivery - 10 days

Yes

Shipping Cost - Varies by product

Average Delivery - 30-0 Days

Max Delivery - Varies by product

Yes

Shipping Cost - Free Shipping

Average Delivery - 1-10 business 

days ARO

Max Delivery - 10 business days ARO

Yes

Shipping Cost - Based on weight of 

order.  Orders over $1000 Marianna 

pays freight.

Average Delivery - 8 days from date 

order received

Max Delivery - 10 days

Yes

Shipping Cost - Free shipping for 5+ 

items.  3.99 per item if less than 5 

items.

Average Delivery - 2 days

Max Delivery - 3 days

Yes

Yes

Shipping Cost - based on weight of 

shipment

Average Delivery - 10-14 business 

days

Max Delivery - 30 business days

Yes

Shipping Cost - Free Shipping with 

$50 Minimum Order

Average Delivery - 3-5 days ARO

*See attachment for details*

$50.00 minimum order for 

discount and free shipping.

Nasco does not provide 

installation, assembly, or 

removal of debris.

Click here for digital catalog

Yes

https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_08_30_12_39_26.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_08_30_12_39_26.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_08_30_12_39_26.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_08_30_12_39_26.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_08_30_12_39_26.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_08_30_12_39_26.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_08_30_12_39_26.pdf
https://www.enasco.com/catalog-directory
https://www.enasco.com/catalog-directory
https://www.enasco.com/catalog-directory
https://www.enasco.com/catalog-directory
https://www.enasco.com/catalog-directory
https://www.enasco.com/catalog-directory
https://www.enasco.com/catalog-directory
https://www.enasco.com/catalog-directory


RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Norton Metals

Nylynn Beauty Products

Ozark Delight Candy Co.

Paxton/Patterson

Penn State Industries

Pivot Point International, Inc.

Shipping/Delivery Additional Notes EPCNT

Shipping Cost - $90 for orders under 

$1500

Average Delivery - 1 business day

Max Delivery - 2/3 business days

Norton Metals terms & 

conditions apply.  Norton 

Metals in not responsible 

for late delivery/additional 

labor charges.  Orders over 

$1500 have delivery fee 

waived as long as customer 

can unload material off 

delivery truck.

Yes

Shipping Cost - $20.00

Average Delivery - 10 days

Max Delivery - 25 days

Yes

Shipping Cost - Variable (approx. $20 

per 480 count box

Average Delivery - 5-7 business days

Max Delivery - 7-10 business days

Yes

Shipping Cost - $10.00 for orders 

over $100.00

Average Delivery - 10-30 days for 

supplies

Max Delivery - 45 days

Reference C757720 when 

placing orders
Yes

Shipping Cost - $8.95 min. plus any 

additional UPS charge next to item.

Average Delivery - 30 days if in stock

Max Delivery - depending of if in 

stock

Yes

Shipping Cost - TBD

Average Delivery - 3-4

Max Delivery - 4-5

Yes



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Pocket Nurse

Project Lead the Way

Public Missiles Ltd.

Quality Audio Visual Service, Inc.

RealityWorks, Inc.

Sargent Welch

School Speciality

Sempco Inc

StuKent, Inc.

Shipping/Delivery Additional Notes EPCNT

Shipping Cost - Free shipping for 

orders over $100 on parcel-type, 

first floor deliveries.  Third party 

freight will be calculated at time of 

order.

Average Delivery - 2-8 weeks

Max Delivery - 8 weeks

Yes

Shipping Cost - $0 for normal 

shipping

Average Delivery - 10 business days

Max Delivery - upto 4 weeks

Click here for list of 

subcontractors.  Pricing 

expires 12/31 and is 

updated the 1st week in 

January.  The website may 

be unavaiable during this 

time.

Yes

Shipping Cost - $14.95

Average Delivery - 1 week

Max Delivery - 2 weeks

Yes

Shipping Cost - $0

Average Delivery - 2 days

Max Delivery - 10 days

Yes

Shipping Cost - varies; $12 minimum

Average Delivery - 15 days

Max Delivery - 90 days

Yes

Shipping Cost - Free ground shipping

Average Delivery - 7-10 days

Max Delivery - 30 days - depending 

on item ordered

Yes

Shipping Cost - Varies.  Please click 

for attachment 

Average Delivery - 7-10 days ARO

Max Delivery - 10 days

Reference #7787939051 

when obtaining a quote & 

should be written on all 

PO's.

Yes

Yes

Shipping Cost - $0 Yes

https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_18_15_03_10.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_18_15_03_10.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_18_15_03_10.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_18_15_03_10.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_18_15_03_10.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_18_15_03_10.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_18_15_03_10.pdf


RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Tabulation

Description>>>

Vendors

Teacher Direct

Texas Pride Marketing

Troxell Communications

U, Inc. DBA S/P2

Vex Robotics

Ward's Science

WB Hunt Co, Inc.

Blank Cell = No Bid

Present at Opening:

Tiffany Mullins, BISD Purchasing

Erika Ayala, BISD Purchasing

Shelley Freeman, BISD Purchasing

GTM Sportswear disqualified due to lack of clarification response

CDW Government, LLC. disqualified due to additonal terms & conditions 

Shipping/Delivery Additional Notes EPCNT

Shipping Cost - $8.00 on orders 

under $48.00

Average Delivery - 2-4 days

Max Delivery - 5 days

*If item ships from manufacturer 

lead time is 2-4 weeks w/ a freight 

charge

Yes

Shipping Cost - Freight prepaid (free) 

on orders over $1000.

Average Delivery - 10 days

Max Delivery - 30 days

Yes

Shipping Cost - See attached Freight 

Statement

Average Delivery - 7-14 days ARO

Max Delivery - 14-30 days ARO

Yes

Shipping Cost - $0

Average Delivery - 1 hour

Max Delivery - 2 hours

Yes

Shipping Cost - Varies; Estimate is 

10% of product cost

Average Delivery - 1-2 business days

Max Delivery - 7 business days

Yes

Shippng Cost - Free ground shipping 

on orders.

Average Delivery - 7-10 days

Max Delivery - 30 days - depending 

on item ordered. 

See attachment

Yes

Shipping Cost - $0 on orders over 

$50

Average Delivery - 7 days

Max Delivery - 30 days

Yes

https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_18_14_14_49.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_18_14_14_49.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_18_14_14_49.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_18_14_14_49.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_18_14_14_49.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_18_14_14_49.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_18_14_14_49.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_17_10_21_14.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_17_10_21_14.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_17_10_21_14.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_17_10_21_14.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_17_10_21_14.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_17_10_21_14.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_17_10_21_14.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_17_10_21_14.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_17_10_21_14.pdf
https://www.birdvilleschools.net/cms/lib/TX01000797/Centricity/Domain/2850/2018_09_17_10_21_14.pdf


RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Rating Schedule

Evaluation Factors The Purchase Price
The reputation  – Based 

on references given.

Quality of the goods 

proposed

Goods meet the 

district’s needs

Past relationship with 

the District

Ability of the district to comply 

with laws and rules relating to 

underutilized businesses.

Total

 Points 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Aerowave Technologies 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%

All American Balloons Wholesale 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%

Alternator Service, Inc. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
American Agro Products 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
American Auto Salvage 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Anchorage Medical Equipment & 

Supplies, LLC.
55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%

Andrea Communications, LLC. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Apogee Components 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Armstrong McCall 55% 0% 1% 18% 5% 1% 80%
Atech Training, Inc. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Aves Audio Visual Systems 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
B&H Photo 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Burmax 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
BWI Companies, Inc. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 0% 99%
Carolina Biological Supply, Co. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
CDW Government, LLC. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Cengage Learning Group 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
CEV Multimedia 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Chef Works, Inc. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Commercial Van Interiors 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Continental Wireless, Inc. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Educational Innovations 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
EmbroidMe 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Fredericksburg Education Initiative, 

Inc. 

DBA SystemsGo

55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%

Gavson, Inc. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
GTM Sportswear 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Hertz Furniture Systems 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%

Impact Promotional Services, LLC. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%

Industrial Controls 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Ipevo 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Jolly Farmer Products US 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
KAMICO Industrial Medial, Inc. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Kari Langford 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Lab Resources, Inc. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Lakeshore Learning 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Marianna Beauty 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Mometrix Test Preparation 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Morgan Electric 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%



RFCSP #002-19 CTE Supplies, Equipment Services

Rating Schedule

Morton Publishing, Co. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Nasco 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Norton Metals 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Nylynn Beauty Products 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Ozark Delight Candy Co. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Paxton/Patterson 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Penn State Industries 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Pivot Point International, Inc. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Pocket Nurse 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Project Lead the Way 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Public Missiles Ltd. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%

Quality Audio Visual Service, Inc. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%

RealityWorks, Inc. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Sargent Welch 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
School Speciality 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Sempco Inc 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
StuKent, Inc. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Teacher Direct 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Texas Pride Marketing 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Troxell Communications 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
U, Inc. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Vex Robotics 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
Ward's Science 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%
WB Hunt Co, Inc. 55% 20% 1% 18% 5% 1% 100%


